
FIGHTING CRIME
o Drafted tough crime
legislation to stop
stalkers, child abusers,
child pornographers,
Medicaid fraud and
abuse of senior citizens
in nursing homes.

o Established the
Gang Task Force to
combat the rising tide of
youth violence.

o Supports tougher
penalties for habitual
violent criminals, repeat
drunk drivers, drive-by
shootings and carjackings.

FIGHTING FOR
CONSUMERS

o Stood up repeatedly to
utility companies when
they overcharged con-
sumers to keep gas, electric
and phone utility rates low.

o Filed more than 50 law
suits on behalf of fraud
victims.

PROTECTING
SENIORS & YOUTH
r Successfully fought for
tougher penalties for
those who abuse senior
citizens in nursing homes
or defraud the elderlv.

o Founder and chairman
of the Arkansas Youth
Suicide Prevention
Commission.

PROTECTING
ARKANSAS'

ENVIRONMENT
o Filed lawsuits to stop.
clear-cutting in the Ozark
and Ouachita National
Forests.

o Closed a landfill in
southeast Arkansas
which was accepting
waste from New Ycrrk

City and sent the garbage
back to New York.

o Stopped the construc-
tion of 3 commercial med-
ical waste incinerators,
preventing Arkansas from
becoming the national
dumping ground for med-
ical waste.
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